MC<H

MCHENRY COUNTY-IL

September 24, 2024

Requesting Department:

Procurement Name:

Recommended Vendors:

Amount of Award:

County of McHenry Purchasing Department
Procurement Executive Summary

Division of Transportation

Bid 25-7593 2025 Sign Materials

Vulcan Signs

Over $30,000 annually. Not to Exceed Budget

Notification and Response

Bid/RFP Due Date:

September 20, 2024

Bids/Proposals Received: 7

Prevailing Wage:

Proprietary:

Award Statement

Yes

Yes

No

_X

Not Applicable X

Eberl Iron Works, High Star Traffic, MDSolutions, RoadSafe Traffic Systems, and

Based on cost and contract compliance, the Director of Transportation/County Engineer and the Director of

Procurement & Special Services recommend awarding this contract to the responsible low bidders, Eberl Iron
Works of Buffalo NY, High Star Traffic of Bartlett IL, MDSolutions of Woodridge IL, RoadSafe Traffic Systems of
Woodridge IL, and Vulcan Signs of Foley AL.

RoadSafe us

Eberl Iron High Star Lightle Traffic Standard
Groups Works Traffic Enterprises | MDSolutions | Systems Sign Vulcan Signs
U-Channel Posts & Post
Pounder Adapter $5,560.18 $6,061.35 $6,849.70 $7,345. No bid No bid No bid
Aluminum Blanks No Bid $12,549.25 | $13,302.25 $13,615.00 No bid $10,276.95 | $9,753.25
Sign Material Roll Goods No Bid $36,941.25 | $28,238.13 $30,379.24 $32,486.84 No Bid $27,578.52
Sign Faces No Bid $10,227.00 | $5,180.85 $3,680.25 No bid No Bid $4,391.55
Roll Up Warning Sign
Assemblies No Bid $9,464.40 $9,114.00 $8,080.00 $6,225.78 No Bid $7,401.27
Sign Mounting Hardware | No Bid No bid No Bid $6,369.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Traffic Control Devices No Bid $43,099.75 | No Bid No Bid $39,649.40 No Bid No Bid
Corrugated Sign Panels No Bid $4,580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Responsive - Responsible | Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




